
Beloved one, when I gave forth what
is now known as The Lord’s Prayer, it
was  to  be an example,  a  framework
upon  which  you  would  weave  your
own prayer.  I  began it  with Our Fa-
ther, for  it  was  in  the  day  and time
when the father was understood to be
the head of the household. Now, at the
point in time and understanding where
you see yourself  to be,  it  could well
be Our  Mother,  Divine  Creator,
Source of All. And because there is an
understood  intimacy,  familiarity,  in
speaking to one’s father, I chose that
wording as an example. “Our Father,
from  whom  we  have  come  and  in
Whose  likeness  we  have  been  cre-
ated.”

Our Father:  Not  just  my Father.  Our
Father, universal. For every prayer, to
be true, must go beyond the singular,
where there would be seen to be sepa-
rateness,  to  go  to  the  place  of  ac-
knowledging  and  remembering  One-
ness of all.

Our  Father,  which  art  in
Heaven:  Heaven, a realm of Oneness
of holiness, of expansion beyond the
specificity of individuality, of person-
ality, lifetime, of any mental concept.
Heaven,  infinite  and  ever-expanding
Totality.

Hallowed be Thy name: Holy, whole,
perfect, complete. Holy is Thy nature.
Perfection,  completeness,  Allness  is
Your essence. That is the nature of the
One Who has brought you forth—and
it is your nature by divine birthright.

Thy  kingdom come: The  kingdom of
Love,  unlimited,  unconditional  love
which sees everyone as the beautiful
radiant Child. Thy kingdom come. Not
as a plea, for you are not plea-bargain-
ing  with  your  Father.  “Thy  king-
dom is come,” as Thy will be done, in
Earth as it is in Heaven. For indeed,
the Kingdom is come on Earth as it is
in  Heaven  when  you  remember  the
Father’s will is only Love—pure, ex-
pansive,  unconditional  Love—wher-
ever you see yourself to be.

Give  us  this  day  our  daily
bread: Again, not said as a plea,  but
as a statement  of  truth.  “You supply
for us in every day our daily bread.”
Bread  for  the  body,  but  more  than
that,  the  bread of  understanding,  the
food, nourishment of the soul. “Give
us our daily bread”—momently, daily.
Not just once, and if you happen to be
out  in  left  field  you  have  missed
it. Daily, on-going.

And allow us to drink from the water
of  Life: That  line  is  not  recorded  in
your  Scriptures,  for  one  of  you,  in

30th ANNIVERSARY
CELEBRATION: A SPECIAL

REUNION

This year marks the 30th anniversary of
the founding of Oakbridge University.
In March of 1989 eight forward-think-
ing souls came together, wrote the Ar-
ticles of Incorporation for the Univer-
sity  and  petitioned  the  Internal  Rev-
enue Service for exemption from fed-
eral  income tax  under  section 501(c)
(3)  as  a  non-profit  corporation  orga-
nized exclusively for religious, charita-
ble, scientific, literary and educational
purposes.

At the first meeting of the Incorpora-
tors,  Eva McGinnis was elected Vice
President of the newly formed Univer-
sity,  (by  the  next  year  Eva  became
President),  and  Judith  Coates  was
named Executive Director of the Cor-
poration to oversee the day-to-day op-
eration of the University. Other Incor-
porators included Thomas Coates, Jan-
ice Huseland, Herbert Huseland, Bette
McBrier,  MarySue  Phillips  and  John
Veatch.

On  Wednesday  evening,  July  17th of
this year, at the Summer Advance we
will  be  having  a  special  anniversary
celebration  highlighting  the  past  his-
tory, classes, activities, Advances (and
where they were held) of the Univer-
sity. Past students have been invited to
speak of their recollections of the ear-
lier days. 

(Continued on page 3)
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copying the  ancient  writings,  missed
that  line.  It  was  at  the  end  of  your
shift and you left, and when you came
back the next day you picked up at the
next line.

And allow us to drink from the water
of Life: the nourishing, refreshing wa-
ter  as  it  nourishes  the  body  and the
soul.

Forgive us our debts, as we also have
forgiven our debtors: Your Father for-
gives you any momentary lapse of re-
membrance,  for  He  does  not  know
lapse of remembrance. Your Father is
Love. You are Love, and as you give
love in forgiveness—for that  is  truly
what forgiveness means: to give love
for, in place of, limited understanding
—as you forgive others what you have
judged as their momentary misunder-
standing, you allow yourself to abide
in the space of unconditional, unlim-
ited Love, and you know forgiveness
yourself.

It is not an exchange. It is not that if
you are good enough to forgive all of
the  ones  you  have  judged  to  have
made  mistakes,  that  somehow  then
you will be good enough that your Fa-
ther will forgive you. It is not an ex-
change.  It  is  a truth:  that  as you are
abiding in judgment, not forgiving an-

other one, you are not knowing love
yourself.  But  as  you  forgive  others
and extend to  them the  Love  of  the
Father, you know that Love for your-
self,  and  instantly  anything  that  you
have judged yourself to be lacking or
at fault for is released, dissolved, for-
gotten, gone forever.

And lead us not into temptation,  but
deliver  us  from  evil: Your  Father
would never lead you into temptation;
He does not know temptation, for that
rests  upon the  concept  of  duality.  A
better  rendering would be,  “leave us
not in temptation,” for truly, when you
turn the focus of your attention unto
the Father, all duality dissolves in the
Light of His Oneness, His Love, and
you  are  delivered  from the  possibil-
ity that there might be such an idea as
the concept of evil. “And You leave us
not in temptation, but deliver us from
the  concept  of  separation  as  our
awareness of Your Love envelops us.”

Whenever you pray, go first unto the
place  of  the  heart,  to  the  place  of
peace,  having  released,  at  least  mo-
mentarily, all of the concerns, the con-
strictions, the judgments of the world.
Go first to the place of the heart and
know the deep abiding peace which is
yours for the asking. 
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And  when  you  pray,  pray  believing
that what you would ask for is already
yours, for verily, it is. There is nothing
that your Father would withhold from
you.  There  is  nothing  that  your  Fa-
ther can withhold  from  you.  As  the
holy creative Child, you have brought
forth  all  of  your  creations  and  your
experiences. You select certain experi-
ences; you try them on for size to see
how they fit. But the Love which you
seek is always yours. The Love which
you seek can be found within the si-
lence of the prayer of your heart.

When you tire of the pain and the hurt

of the world, turn then to the place of
the  heart  and  pray  the  breath  of  the
soul. Pray to the one Father Who will
never, can never, abandon you;  Who
is there, in Truth, to supply your every
need. It is yours for the asking.

Now, there are times when you would
pray, in limited thinking, for specifics,
and  you  would  ask  of  your  Father
what He does not have in specific to
give you. In other words, do not pray
to your Father for the vehicle, for the
dwelling place, for He does not have
that  in specific to give to you.  They
are  creations  within your  Adventure.
But  that  which  He  has  is  yours  al-
ready.  That  which He has  is  beyond
the value of the world. That which he
has is freely given, and it is the pearl
of great price.

He gives you freely of Life,  of  con-
sciousness, of creativity, which is your
natural  birthright.  Then you take the
consciousness  and the  creativity  and
apply  it  to  the  specific  which  you
would see in your life. Pray believing
that you already have, for indeed you
do.

If you would know the beauty of the
clouds, do not keep the head and eyes 

cast  down.  If  you  would  know  the
Love of the Father, allow yourself the
moments of prayer, where He is to be
found. If you would know the Love of
your Father, allow yourself time, your
precious  time,  to  focus  upon  the
peace, the beauty in the heart and the
beauty  in  manifest  form  rather  than
focusing upon what seemingly is lack-
ing or wrong.  For as you keep your
focus upon what is seemingly wrong,
you deny in that moment the desire of
the heart.

Allow yourself the times of prayer, of
true  prayer.  And  when  you  do,
beloved one,  you will  be  greatly  re-
warded. For you are loved with an ev-
erlasting Love which the world cannot
know and does not value. But you are
not of the world. You are of your Fa-
ther, and He awaits you in the place of
true prayer. 

--Jesus Speaks: Don’t Look for Me in
a Tortilla Chip, Volume III in Jeshua:
The Personal Christ series, Chapter 8,
pp.  65-68.  A wonderful  book  about
the deeper meanings of Bible passages
and Jesus’ ministry. It may be ordered
from  our  website: www.oak-
bridge.org. $12.95  

30th Anniversary Celebration        

(Continued from page 1)

YOU  are  invited  to  come  for  the
Evening or for the week!

And if you were one of the early stu-
dents of OU, let us hear from you re-
garding  your  memories.  Send  (or
bring) photographs if you have them.
We  will  be  compiling  a  Book  of
Memories. Make sure your name and
photographs are in it!

                                            --Judith

JESHUA Q&A

BACKSTABBING IN THE
WORKPLACE

I don’t want it to sound very egotisti-
cal, but there’s a lot of backstabbing
going on right now at work (Oh, yes)
Why  is  there  so  much  jealousy  out
there?

It comes from that feeling of insecu-
rity.  It  is  fear-based,  and  it  says,  “I
have  been  taught,  I  have  heard  the
whispers  around  the  edges  that  I’m
not good enough, that I should work
harder,  I  should  look  prettier,  I
should…”  all  of  the  shoulds.  They
have  tried  a  lot  of  the  shoulds,  and
that doesn’t make them more success-
ful, so they try harder. But it is fear-
based, and what is most necessary is
for  them to  stop,  to  breathe,  to  take
stock  of  the  fact  that  they  are  good
enough; otherwise, they would not be;
they would not  be here. So however
you  can  put  that  forward  for  ones,
they may hear it, they probably won’t
hear it, but that is underlying what is
happening. They feel—and it is false,
as you have seen—that if they put an-
other one down, then that raises them
up, but it does not. They still feel bad
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about themselves, so they turn around
and find someone else  that  they can
try to bring down. 

IS THE MOON HOLLOW?

Two of the astronauts on a recent trip
to the moon—when one of the compo-
nents dropped to the moon—detected
a vibration for three hours, increasing
vibration, so it was indicative that the
moon was hollow (Yes) So I wondered
what you thought about that.

Well,  beloved  brother,  I  try  not  to
think (Laughter) I try to Be. Yes, there
is quite a history to your moon, and
you  have  come  away  from  the  pro-
gram that  you  saw with  more  ques-
tions  than  answers.  You  have  come
away wondering,  “How did it  get  to
be the exact size that it is? Is it really
hollow?  What  is  happening  on  the
other side that is never turned toward
the Earth?” 

All of these questions have been run-
ning around in your mind. In truth, do
you want the answer? (Yes) Ah, okay.
Yes, in truth, it is hollow. Yes, it was
made  to  the  exact  dimensions  that
ones  designed.  “Which  ones,”  you
say, “which ones?” You, as you would
now  call  yourself  an  extra…ha,  are
you an extra in this play? Yes, I sup-
pose you are. Extraterrestrial. You, as
the Intelligence that you are, you de-
signed and then put it in the recesses
of memory, this object to shine upon
you in the evening when the daytime
light  has  gone  to  bed,  so  to  speak.
Anyway,  so that  you have the moon
reflecting the sunlight. It has been by
design. Play with that for a while. So,
yes,  the  moon is  not  made of  green
cheese, but it is hollow, and it was de-
signed by an Intelligence that you are
not  separate  from,  and you are  now
coming—you  and  a  group  of  ones
who  are  the  enquiring  minds…you
have a saying, “Enquiring minds want

to know” how this came to be. Why
did this come to be? What is the pur-
pose? And you have had all kinds of
stories  about  the  moon.  It  has  been
fascinating  down  through  the  ages,
and it will continue to be fascinating
for a while, until the purpose has been
fulfilled. 

UPCOMING TRIP TO MARS

What do you think about the  trip  to
Mars?

It’s fun. Hopefully, the ones who will
be doing it will be sending back pic-
tures  so  that  you  can  participate  in
knowing what it might feel like if you
were onboard and landing and looking
for the first time to what would seem
to  be  a  new  world,  a  new environ-
ment. What is happening now is most
wondrous, because the human mind is
allowing the shutters of the mind, the
shutters that  have been so closed,  to
be thrown open, sort of like the blin-
ders on a horse, as it used to be, being
opened up and to say, “Oh, what is out
there?  What  is  there?  How did  that
come  to  be?  Why did  that  come  to
be?” 

So you are living at a time where you
are  getting  information,  enough  to
make  question  marks,  and  you  are
putting the period to it and saying, “I
want to know.” So seemingly through
an extension of what you see yourself
to be; in other words, another human
being or a group of human beings are
putting  together  the  technology  that
can  go  and see  with  the  mechanical
eyes what you would see if you were

actually  taking  the  body.  Now,  in
time,  you are going to be taking the
body  to  these  other  locations.  But
meantime, in the history it seems to be
a beginning time. Actually, it is a re-
membrance  time,  because  you  have
lived within some of these planetary
bodies in other constellations as well.
That is how infinite you are—you as
the One, the divine Self, the creative
Principle,  the  creative  One,  out  of
which everything comes and will con-
tinue to come as long as you ask for it
to be. And when you get tired of one
topic,  you  will  choose  another  one.
But,  yes,  it  is  going  to  be  most  in-
structive  and  interesting  to  you.
(Thank you)

NATIVE AMERICAN VISITOR

I had a vision, I do believe it was a vi-
sion  of  a  Native  American  standing
next to my bed, and I’m asking, what
does he want? And at the same time I
saw a lot of Indians coming down. Do
I now know the answer, that they are
coming down to help us? Instead of
keeping  the  secrets  that  they  have
been keeping, they are now going to
open up?

Yes.  (So that’s what I saw?)  Yes, that
is what you saw, and now you proba-
bly have the question, “Why me?” It
is because you have background in the
thinking and the lifetimes of the Na-
tive Americans as well. It has been put
far into the recesses of your memory,
so it has not been at the top of your
memory,  but  it  is  coming  more,  be-
cause  it  is  very  much  in  alignment
with where you are in your thinking as
to the shaman. And it is not strange. It
is not strange, far-off. It is very much
in alignment. So allow yourself to be
open,  which  you  are,  and  to  say,
“Okay,  speak  to  me.  Speak  through
me,” because that is the next step that
is going to be happening if you allow



it. (I thought so) You thought so (Yes,
I did)

I felt that I actually saw him. It wasn’t
a dream. I felt that when I sat up, that
I looked right  at him with that  flesh
on. What was that?

Yes, it was flesh; made flesh for you
so  that  you would  believe.  You  see,
miracles  still  happen.  They  are  not
just  something  in  the  past.  Miracles
happen every day.

Okay,  and  the  next  question  is,  just
like I had the words, “It is finished,” I
also  had…I  can’t  pronounce  it  re-
ally…Melchizedek.  That  word is  just
in my spirit, so what is that about?

That is for you to research.

I did. What I came up with, which I’ve
known for a while, he was the person
who  accepted  tithes  from  the  kings
(Right) and I thought maybe from you
too  (Yes)  You  didn’t  give  tithes,
though, did you?

Not a tithe in the money sense. Tithes
as a portion of the truth that is being
shared—that kind of tithe.

Okay. So why did he come to me?

Well, first of all, why not? Second of
all, it came to you because it is some-
thing  that  is  near  and  dear  to  your
heart, to give back a portion of your-
self,  whatever  that  might  be,  to  the
Source of your Being. 

Oh, wow.

You see, the inner soul of you, the in-
ner Self of you is  far wiser than the

outer  self.  The  outer  self  is  the  one
that  comes  forward  with  all  of  the
questions and says, “Who, why, when,
etc.?”  But  the  inner  Self  of  you  is
nudging, is saying to you, “You know
these answers. You know the message
of  the  heart,”  and your  brothers  and
sisters are calling out for you to speak
words of comfort, words of wisdom to
them, words of  encouragement.  That
is truly what we were speaking of this
evening  regarding  the  changes  that
you  see  happening,  There  will  be
many who will be coming to you, and
they will have very deep-seated ques-
tions  that  they  are  struggling  with.
And you, because you are open to the
history of yourSelf—capital “S”—you
will be able to go deep within and find
the  answer  that  then  allows  them to
smile, to feel healed again.

Okay; yes, I got that.

Good; I knew you would. Thank you,
beloved one.

 

MALDEK

It’s  interesting  that  you  brought  up
Maldek, the world I assume many of
us  lived  on  before.  When  we  popu-
lated the Earth, did we come together
again as the one consciousness onto
this planet?

Yes.  Many of  the  grouping that  was
on Maldek have come to holy Mother
Earth  and  have  a  certain  feeling  of
needing  to  take  care  of  this  planet.
Now,  there  are  other  seed  ones  who
are  here  on  holy  Mother  Earth  who
did  not  have  the  experience  of
Maldek, and they are the ones who are
being  most  creative  of  thinking,
“Well, you know, I can say…etc. and
it will be okay.” So then the ones of
you who have experience having the
planet  truly explode into pieces,  you

have said, “Wait a second, let’s put the
brakes on. We don’t really want to go
there.  We’ve  been  there,  done  that,
don’t  need  to  repeat  it.”  So  you are
as…I will not say older brothers and
sisters, because there is no age differ-
ential. The ones who have not had the
experience  on  Maldek  are  the  ones
who  had  other  experiences  that  per-
haps  you  haven’t  had,  so  they  can
speak  to  other  topics,  other  adven-
tures.

Did anybody get off the planet Maldek
physically  before  it  exploded?  Was
there space travel at that time?
Yes,  there were ones  who knew this
was coming and made preparation and
were in space, although they felt  the
wave of  the  energy when all  of  this
happened,  because  truly  all  of  the
planets that are circling your star felt
the  great  explosion  of  energy,  and
some were thrown off of their previ-
ous course. So there has been a bit of
the  depiction…you  have  pictures  in
caves of certain what has been called
scientific or reckoning of history, per-
haps, where there have been the draw-
ings.  Because  of  space  travel,  ones
knew  the  various  holy  bodies  that
were circling your star, and there have
been  some  of  the  cave  drawings
showing what was remembered in the
psyche  of  a  group  of  certain  ones.
Your  scientists  come along now and
read this, and they say that that is out
of place. Well, yes, it was thrown out
of place.

I’ve read that the moon at one point
was part of the Earth and was thrown



off the Earth; I mean, separation hap-
pened.  Was  that  part  of  what  hap-
pened at this time?

That is how some of the other planets,
as  you call  them,  have  more  moons
circling.  They  are  pieces  that  were
forced out.

So when we came to this planet,  we
communicated mind to mind, not nec-
essarily by words (Right) So was that
the initial  language that  is  often de-
scribed in the Bible about one point
when  everybody  on  Earth  spoke  the
same language?

Yes, and then there was the sound that
came forth and became as babel, as it
is called, that developed with all  the
different languages and dialects.
So  the  Tower  of  Babel,  was  that  a
communication  tower  with  ET’s?
(Yes)  But  it  was  destroyed by  those
ET’s? They didn’t want us all  speak-
ing  the  same  language?  I  mean,  in
that  story,  God,  or  the  gods seemed
very judgmental about, well, we don’t
want you to be as good as we are, or
as I am, so they destroyed this com-
munication center, and people scatter
and have different languages.  And it
seems to me that that might even be
the origin of our miscommunications
and the basis for wars in the future.

Yes, and it is. The non-understanding
of One. It was not destroyed by outer
circumstance.  It  was  destroyed  be-
cause of the invention, if you want to
call  it  that,  of  sound  language  and
ones  feeling  that  as  they  traveled  a
distance away, in time—you have no-
ticed  this  as  well—the  language
would  take on a  different  nuance of
some sort. Sound would change a bit,
and  that  is  what  happened.  It  was a
gradual  evolution.  It  was  not  some-
thing  that  was  done  all  of  a  sudden
with  forethought.  It  was  something
that evolved.

So if we were so good at being able to
read each other’s minds, why did we
need a language?

Creativity  (We just  wanted  to  try  it)
Yes. And an idea. And when once an
idea comes and lands in the mind, it
has to be out-pictured at some point,
at  some  time.  So  the  idea  came,
“What can we do with sound? What
does it mean?”

Well, it can be beautiful like the mu-
sic, or it can be used to hurt someone
(Exactly)  So part of our healing and
our sense of Oneness is to come back
to being able to communicate mind to
mind, heart to heart, where we actu-
ally feel it and live it, so we don’t feel
the separation that then brings all this
other  chaos (Right;  you’ve  got  it)
Okay,  I’m  communicating  with  you
heart to heart (Yes, you are) 

THE PRIME DIRECTIVE

Interesting  discussion  about  the
Prime  Directive (Yes)  Do  no  harm;
that’s the first part of it (Exactly) Be-
cause last time I had the message at
the Unity Church, when I was trying
to tune in and figure out what I was
meant to say, the Prime Directive was
what came up for me, and that’s what
I talked about. And I thought I heard
you say that the Prime Directive for
our planet  is  evolving,  that  the  very
first…going back in history when I re-
searched  this,  the  part  about  “Do
unto others as you would have done
to  you,”  the  Golden  Rule  was  the
first. And you came and elevated that
to “Love one another” (Right)  So is
that the evolving of our Prime Direc-
tive on this planet?  (Yes) From “Do
No  Harm”,  to  “Love” (Yes)  and
that’s where we’re heading.

Yes, you’re very much in the stream
of that evolution, as you call it.

 

FORGIVENESS

Is forgiveness truly just a matter of re-
alizing that there is nothing to forgive
and that we are all One?

Yes,  that  is  the  basis  for  it.  But  the
true  clue  to  remember  what  forgive-
ness is,  is  to remember to  give love
for.

 



 


